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NOTICE TO PROCEED

Dear Mr./Ms. Co

Please be informed that you may now proceed as the Supplier for the contract entitled SUPPLY ANO
DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWO FO V (LOT 1-4) with ITB No. lB GOP 2024-
DSWD-036 and Contract No.2024-026 amounting to ONE MILLION EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY EIGHT
THOUSAND EIGHT HUNORED EIGHTY FOUR PESOS ANO NO CENTAVOS (Pl,858,884.00), inclusive of all
applicable taxes.

This Notice binds you to your bid price proposal, schedule of requirements, technical specifications, and other
terms and conditions slipulated in the Contract. Please note that complete delivery of goods shall be made
within 30 Galendar days upon receipl of lhis notice. Further, we acknowledge receipt of your Performance
Security in a form of:

Kindly affix your signature and the sponding date in the space provided below:

Ass slrnl ly ACn,r slt;:cn

dNORMAN S. LAURI
Regional Director

c6trronut,
v---F-t taat a. co

PC EXPERTS

Authorized Repres

Dare: fuo/ 25
entative
,zoz)
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(Ploaso

chock lypo
ol S6curity)

Form of Perlormance
Securit Amount of Performance Security/ Remarka

Cash or Cashiels / Manage/s
Check

Bank Dra{Ucuarantee or
irrevocable letter of credit

Surety Bond
30% of the Contract Price/Five Hundred Fifty-Seven Thousand Six Hundred

Sixty-Five Pesos (P557,665.00); Performance Bond

ll'

Cit,, Philippines 4500oSWO fietObince v, negionsl Govememsnt Center Site' Rawis. tegazpi io
.;

o"", N0V 21 2C24

JOi'ARI B. CO
Proprietor
PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING
868 Purok 4 Baniada Brgy. Gogon Legazpi City

Very truly yours,

Coi|tarr ,.r15 a lcccssorias Trading



Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT

Field Office V, Legazpi City

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO VPROJECT

CONTRACT NO.: 2024-026

CONTRACT AGREEMENT

THIS AGREEMENT made this O\l 15 ?02I between DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL

WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT FTELD OFFICE V of the Philippines, hereinafter called "the Entity

of the one part and Pc EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING, of 868

purok 4 Barriada Brgy. Gogon Legazpi city hereinafter called "the Supplie/' of the other part;

WHEREAS, the Entity invited Bids for certain goods and ancillary services, particularly SUPPLY AND

DELTVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V (LOT 14), and has accepted a

Bid by the Supplier for the supply of those goods and services in the sum of ONE MILLION EIGHT

HUNDRED FIFTY EIGHT THdUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED EIGHTY FOUR PESOS AND NO

CENTAVOS (P,l,858,884.00) hereinafter called "the Contract Price"'

NOW THIS AGREEMENT WITNESSETH AS FOLLOWS:

1 , ln this Agreement words and expressions shall have the same meanings as are respectively

assigned to them in the Conditions of Contract referred to'

2. The following documents as required by the 2016 revised lmplementing Rules and Regulations of

Republic Act No. 9184 shall be deemed to form and be read and construed as integral part of this

Agreement, v2. :

i. Philippine Bidding Documents (PBDs);

i. Schedule of Requirements;
ii. TechnicalSpecifications;
iii. General and Special Conditions of Contract; and

iv. Supplemental or Bid Bulletins, if any

ii. Winning bidder's bid, including the Eligibility requirements, Technical and

FinancialProposals'andallotherdocumentsorstatementssubmitted;

Bid form, including all the documents/statements contained in the Bidder's bidding

envelopes, as annexes, and all other documents submitted (e g , Bidder's response

to request for clarifications on the bid), including corrections to the bid, if any,

resulting from the Procuring Entity's bid evaluation;

l Performance Security;

Notice of Award of Contract; and the Bidder's conforme thereto; and



Other contract documents that may be required by existing laws and/or the
Procuring Entity concerned in the PBDs. @!4g bidder aqrees that additional
contract documents or information prescribed ry the GPPB that are
subsequently reouired for submission after the contract execution. such as the
Notice to Proceed. Variation Orders. and Warrantv Securlw. shall likewise form
part of the Contract.

3. ln consideration for the sum of ONE MILLION EIGHT HUNDRED FIFTY EIGHT THOUSAND
EIGHT HUNDRED EIGHTY FOUR PESOS AND NO CENTAVOS (Pl,858,884.00) or such other sums
as may be ascertained,PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING, agrees
to provide,SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V (LOT 1'

4), in accordance with his/her/its Bid;

4. The DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT FIELD OFFICE V agrees to
pay the above-mentroned sum tn accordance with the terms of the Bidding.

lN WITNESS whereof the parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed in accordance
with the laws of the Republic of the Philippines on the day and year first above written.

OMARI B. CO
Authorized Signatory

4 /L
VICTORIA
SWOV/

TAGUM
D Chief

dr
for

DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL
WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT

FIELD OFFICE V

SupplierANit NCSS

for

PC EXPERTS COMPUTER
PARTS AND ACCESSORIES

TRADING

cERrFrE9luNDS AVAILABLE:

A.
wENilV&. RANcEs, cPA

Accountant lll

NORMAN S. LAURIO
Regional Director



ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

.l{oy 1 5 202+
BEFORE ME, a Notary Public this dayof

at I l;t:^ant ,rt?u personally appeared
NORMAN s. LAURIO and JoMARTEI?tl-8xXfuh8o to me their Competent
Evidence of ldentity lD No. 05-0002 issued in Quezon Citv on September !!
2022 and lD No. issued at issued on

respectively. Known to me to be the person who
executed the foregoing instrument and acknowledgment to me the same as
their free act and that of the principal they represent. This instrument consists
of Three (3) pages including the page, on which, the acknowledgment is

written.

WITNESS MY HAND AND SEAL on the dat and place written.

ATTY, RO O LEONES MADRID
NO RY PUtsIIC

Series No.

UNTIL DECE}1BER 31, 2025
rBP N0. 122023 - 12 t 141 2023
PTR. No, 7209744-01 l09 tZl

AT LEGAZPI CITY, A LBAY
R0LL 0F ATI0RNEy'S No.30786

MCLE N0. v.001706.t.MARC1{ 15. 2015

Doc. No.
Page No.
Book No.

REPUBLIC OF THE PHTLTPPTNES)

ctrY oF LEGAZPI ClTlls.s.
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NOTICE OF AWARD

JOMARI B. CO
Proprietor
PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING
868 Purok 4 Barriada Brgy. Gogon Legazpi City

Dear Ms. Co:

This is to notify you that your bid for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND
EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V (LOT 1-4) with a Contract Price equivalent to ONE MILLION
EIGHT HUNDRED FIFry EIGHT THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED EIGHTY FOUR PESOS
AND NO CENTAVOS (P1,858,884.00) as corrected and modified in accordance with the
lnstructions to Bidders is hereby accepted.

You are hereby required to provide within ten ('10) days the performance security in the form
and amount stipulated in Section 39 of the Revised IRR of RA 9184. Failure to provide the
performance security shall constitute sufficient ground for cancellation of the award and
forfeiture of the bid security.

Very u rs,

Conforme

PC EXPERT-T
eamlular lrrts I lcccsscrirs lr ,.ARI B. CO

llor \ . zi'; 4

P-{Gf I of I

ORMAN S. LAU
Regional Director

Name of Bidder:

Date Received:

DswD Field offic€ v, Regional covemement Center Sile, Rawis. r,egazpi City, Philippioes 4500
Websitei !-lt-tII:/i\t !t\ -tllt\:d_.eq\ l]-lr

y'tB

L



Field Oflice V-Bi@l Region
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION No. 2024-10-075

DS COMMTTTEE (BAC)
RSO 47s1 5.2024

DSWD-AS-GF-088 | REV 01 I 28 SEPT 2022

WHEREAS, during the deadline for the submission/opening of bids on October 01, 2024, al8:00 AII, only one (1) bid
proposal was received by the BAC Secretariat as indicated below. Opening of Bids and examination of the presence or
absence of the required eligibility, technical, and fnancial documents were done using a non-discrelionary "pass/fail" criteria
having hereunder result:

WHEREAS, no bid was received forLolS;

WHEREAS, failure of bidding for Lot 5 was declared through BAC Resolution No. 2024-10-059 dated October 21, 2024;

WHEREAS, during the detailed bid evaluation PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING was
declared Eligible;

WHEREAS, a post-qualification evaluation was conducted on October 21, 2024, by the BAC to PC EXPERTS COMPUTER
PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING. As per report submitted by the Post-Qualification Team, the said bidder was found
responsive as the technical documents submitted such as PhiIGEPS registration, Bid Security, and Omnibus Swom
Statement are laMul and valid based on the effectivity date of each document. The required amount of transadions for the

PAGf, I of2
DSWD Field Office V, Regional Govememedt Center Site, Rawis, Legazpi City, Philippines 4500

Website: hllp.//!1tl\!!t1!.9!\4!1

PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND
ACCESSORIES TRADING

868 Purok 4 Barriada Brgy. Gogon Legazpi City

TECHNICAL COMPONENT ENVELOPE

PhiIGEPS Certiricate of Registration and Membership Passed

Statement of all ongoing government and private contracts Passed
Statement of the Bidde/s Single Largest Completed
Contract (SLCC) similar to the contract to be bid, within two
(2) years from the submission of bids

Passed

Bid Security Passed
Conformitv with lechnical speciflcations Passed
Omnibus Sworn Statement Passed
Audited Financial Statement Passed
NFCC computation or Committed Line of Credit (CLC) Passed
Joint Venture Agreement, if applicable N/A
FINANCIAL PROPOSAL
Financial Bid Form, and the applicable Price Schedules Passed
ABC in Philippine Peso N/A

LOT 1 ?270,000.00 F 234,500.00
LOT 2 P176,600.00 r71,860.00
LOT 3 Ps04,991.00 P 500,899.00
LOT 4 1989,000.00 ? 951,625.00
LOT 5 P245,000.00 NO BID

REMARKS Eliqible

y'AR

A RESOLUTION RECOMMENDING TO THE REGIONAL DIRECTOR TO AWARD THE CONTRACT FOR THE
SUPPLY ANO OELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V LOT I TO 4 TO PC EXPERTS

COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING AS THE SOLE ELIGIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDOER

WHEREAS various Programs/Sections requested for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
FOR DSWD FO V amounting to Two Million One Hundred Eighty-Five Thousand Five Hundred Ninety-One Pesos only
(P2,1E5,591-00), hence the said procurement opportunity was posted on PhiIGEPS per lB GOP 2024-DSWD-036; on the
department's website and on a conspicuous place within the agency for wider dissemination;

WHEREAS, the request as mentioned above is included in the Annual Procurement Plan (APP) of the Agency fot CY 2024

WHEREAS, several bidders were present during the scheduled Prc-Bid Conference last September 18, 2024, at 8:30 AM,
namely PC Experts Computer Parts and Accessories Trading, lT Avenue, Denver's Computer Shoppe, Inc., and PixelS Web
Solutions & Consultancy lnc.;

REQUIREMENTS

P
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BIDS AND AWAYDS COMMITTEE (BAC)

ON LEAVE
MA. CARMEN T. TAYAM

AO V, Budget Section Head
Vice-Chairperson

LL BAS
sion

on ber

E@ RSO475I5.2024
DSWD-AS-GF-088 | REV 01 | 28 SEPT 2022

completed contract is complied with and surpassed. The Single Largest Completed Contract presented was with with DSWD
FO V for the Procurement of ICT Equipment & Peripherals for the Pantawid of DSWD FO V amounting lo P1,272,525.0O
amounting to P1,974,588.50i Copies of the NOA, Contract, Delivery Receipt, IAR, Sales lnvoice, Official Receipt and olher
related documents were presented upon inspection. The post-qualitication team noted lhat the specifcations indicated in the
bid document were all complied.

WHEREAS, PC EXPERTS COIVIPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING was assessed as Post-Qualified by the
PoslQualification Team per submitted PoslQualification Report.

WHEREAS, with the foregoing and after due deliberation, the Bids and Awards Committee resolved to declare the bid of PC
EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING as Responsive Bid;

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the lv'lembers of the Bids and Awards Committee RESOLVES, as it is hereby RESOLVEO, to
recommend to lhe HoPE of DSWD FO V to;

a) To declare PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING as the Sole and Responsive Bidder
for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V LOT I TO 4;

b) To recommend the Award of the Contract to PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING as
the Sole and Responsive Bidder for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR
DSWD FO V LOT I TO 4 amounting to

LOT 1 P 234,500.00
LOT 2 ? 171,860.00
LOT 3 I 500,899.00
LOT 4 I 951,625.00

Done this 29th of

REAL JR
lC-Chiefo

JOSEPH L. TESTON
PO lll, PPD OIC-Chief

Regular Member

JAN
AO ,

BOT
Section
mber

Au

MELANIE B. GARRIDO
SWO ll. Soctech

Provisional - Alternate Member

( ) App d ( ) Disapproved

(pe 2022)
cuing Entity

PAGE 2 of2

UDIO A.

be

o.
dg

Dllecror, DSWD FO V
ecial Order No.305r, Senes

Represe ntative/Head of

MAN S. LAURIO

DSWD Field Ofiice V, Regional Govemeficnt Center Sile. Rawis, bgazpi City, Philippines 4500
W€bsite: lr!!p:i A\\\\\ !!!\dg!)\ .ph

)y'tn

in Legazpi City, Philippines.

Chairperson
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

RESOLUTION No. 2024-10-075

A RESOLUTION RECOMMENDING TO THE REGIONAL DIRECTOR TO AWARD THE CONTRACT FOR THE
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V LOT I TO 4 TO PC EXPERTS

COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING AS THE SOLE ELIGIBLE ANO RESPONSIVE BIDOER

WHEREAS, several bidders were present during the scheduled Pre-Bid Conference last September 18, 2024, at 8:30 AM,
namely PC Experts Computer Parts and Accessories Trading, lT Avenue, Oenvefs Computer Shoppe, lnc., and PixelS Web
Solutions & Consultancy lnc.;

WHEREAS, during the deadline for the submission/opening of bids on October O'1,2024, al8:00 AM, only one (1) bid
proposal was received by the BAC Secretariat as indicated below. Opening of Bids and examination of the presence or
absence ofthe required eligibility, technical, and tinancial documents were done using a non-discretionary "pass/fail" criteria
having hereunder result:

WHEREAS, no bid was received for Lot 5l

WHEREAS, failure of bidding for Lot 5 was declared through BAC Resolution No. 2024-10-059 dated October 21, 2024;

WHEREAS, during the detailed bid evaluation PC EXPERTS COIVIPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING was
declared Eligible;

WHEREAS, a post-qualification evaluation was conducted on October 21, 2024, by the BAC to PC EXPERTS COMPUTER
PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING. As per report submitted by the Post-Qualification Team, the said bidder was found
responsive as the technical documents submitted such as Ph|IGEPS registration, Bid Security, and Omnibus Sworn
Statement are laMul and valid based on the effectivity date of each document. The required amount of transactions for the

PAGI I of2

REQUIREMENTS PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND
ACCESSORIES TRADING

868 Purok 4 Barriada Brgy. Gogon Legazpi City

TECHNICAL COMPONENT ENVELOPE

PhiIGEPS Certificate of Registration and Membership Passed

Statement of all ongoing government and private contracts Passed
Statement of the Bidder's Single Largest Completed
Contract (SLCC) similar to the contract to be bid, within two
(2) vears from the submission of bids

Passed

Bid Security Passed
Conformity with technical specifi cations Passed
Omnibus Sworn Statement Passed
Audited Financial Statement Passed
NFCC computation or Committed Line of Credit (CLC) Passed
Joint Venture Agreement, if applicable N/A
FINANCIAL PROPOSAL
Financial Bid Form, and the applicable Price Schedules Passed
ABC in Philippine Peso N/A

LOT 1 p270,000.00 P 234,500.00
LOT 2 P176,600.00 P 171,860.00
LOT 3 P504,991.00 P 500,899.00
LOT 4 P{)89,000.00 P 951,625.00
LOT 5 P245,000.00 NO BIO

REMARKS Elisible

DSWD Field Oftice V, Regional Govemement Center Site, Rawis, Legazpi City, Philippines 4500
W€bsile: hltp:,^!r\\\ d\!\d go\ ph o

WHEREAS various Programs/Sections requested for the SUPPLY AND OELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
FOR DSWD FO V amounting to Two Million One Hundred Eighty-Five Thousand Fiv€ Hundred Ninety-One Pesos only
(?2,f 85,591.00), hence the said procurement opportunity was posted on PhiIGEPS per lB GOP 2024-OSWD-036; on the
department's website and on a conspicuous place within the agency for wider dissemination;

WHEREAS, the request as mentioned above is included in the Annual Procurement Plan (APP) of the Agency lot CY 2024;
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completed contract is complied wilh and surpassed. The Single Largest Completed Contracl presented was with with DSWD
FO V for the Procurement of ICT Equipment & Peripherals for the Pantawid of DSWD FO V amounting lo P1,272,525.00
amounting to Pl,974,588.50; Copies of the NOA, Contract, Delivery Receipt, lAR, Sales lnvoice, Official Receipt and other
related documents were presented upon inspeciion. The poslquali{lcation team noted that the specilications indicated in the
bid document were all complied.

WHEREAS, PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING was assessed as Post-Qualified by the
PostQualification Team per submitted Post-Qualification Report.

WHEREAS, with the foregoing and after due deliberation, the Bids and Awards Committee resolved to declare the bid of PC

EXPERTS COL4PUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING as Responsive Bidi

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee RESOLVES, as it is hereby RESOLVED, to
recommend to the HoPE of DSWD FO V to:

a) To declare PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING as the Sole and Responsive Bidder
foT the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES ANO EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V LOT I TO 4i

b) To recommend the Award of the Contract to PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND ACCESSORIES TRADING as
the Sole and Responsive Bidder for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR
DSWD FO V LOT I TO 4 amounting to

LOT 1 P 234,500.00
LOT 2 P 171,850.00
LOT 3 P 500,899.00
LOT 4 P 95't,625.00

Done this 29rh of in Legazpi City, Philippines

ON LEAVE
MA, CARMEN T. TAYAM

AO V, Budget Section Head
Vice-Chairperson

BrDS AND AWAk.DS COMMTTTEE (BAC)

BAS
d Division

I t\.4 ber

MELANIE B. GARRIDO
SWO II. Soctech

Provisional - Alternate Member

( ) Approvsd ( )Disapproved

(per

PA(;[ 2 of 2

LJR
hieforc-c

Chairperson

JOSEPH L. TESTON
PO lll, PPD OIC-Chief

Regular Member

JAN
AO [,

BOT
Section

Altern ber

Autho

L

io

NO

ber

LAUDIO A.

D

P
O,P

/ Direcror, DSWD FO V
Order No. 3051. Seies of

Re p re se ntative/l'l e ad of the

S. LAURIO

DSWD Ficld Omc€ v, Regional Covememenr Center Site, Rawis. LegazpiCity, Philippines 4500
website: lIlP ',(\\\Lllr\d g(\ fh ,./ 1B

tq

Entity
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A RESOLUTION RECOMMENDING TO THE REGIONAL DIRECTOR TO DECLARE A
FAILURE OF BIDDING PER SECTION 35.I.A OF THE REVISED IRR OF RA 9184 FOR THE

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V LOT 5

WHEREAS various Programs/Sections requested for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT
SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FO V amounting to Two Million One Hundred Eighty-
Five Thousand Five Hundred Ninety-One Pesos only (P2,185,591.00), hence the said procurement
opportunity was posted on PhiIGEPS per lB GOP 2024-DSWD-036, on the department's website and
on a conspicuous place within the agency for wider dissemination;

WHEREAS, the request as mentioned above is included in the Annual Procurement Plan (APP) of the
Agency for CY 2024,

WHEREAS, during the deadline for the submission/opening of bids on October 01, 2024, at 8:00 AM,
only one (1) bid proposal was received by the BAC Secretariat as indicated below. Opening of Bids
and examination of the presence or absence of the required eligibility, technical, and financial
documents were done using a non-discretionary "pass/fail" criteria having hereunder result.

P,{G[, I of 2

REQUIREMENTS PC EXPERTS COMPUTER PARTS AND
ACCESSORIES TRADING

868 Purok 4 Barriada Brgy. Gogon Legazpi
City

TECHNICAL COMPONENT ENVELOPE
PhiIGEPS Certificate of Registration and
Membership

Passed

Statement of all ongoing government and private
contracts

Passed

Statement of the Bidder's Single Largest
Completed Contract (SLCC) similar to the
contract to be bid, within two (2) years from the
submission of bids

Passed

Bid Security Passed
Conformity with technical specifications Passed
Omnibus Sworn Statement Passed
Audited Financial Statement Passed
NFCC computation or Committed Line of Credit
(cLc)

Passed

Joint Venture Agreement, if applicable N/A
FINANCIAL PROPOSAL
Financial Bid Form, and the applicable Price
Schedules.

Passed

ABC in Philippine Peso N/A
LOT 1 p270,000.00 P 234,s00.00
LOT 2 p176,600.00 ? 171,860.00

DSWD Field OfAc. v, Regional Govemement Center Site. Rawis, Legszpi City, Philippines 4500
Website: !!tl}t 1\\ \tl!!!\ilgq llr fr y'tn

Freld otlre v- Br@l Regbtr

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION No. 2024-{0-059

WHEREAS, several bidders were present during the scheduled Pre-Bid Conference last September
18,2024, at 8:30 AM, namely PC Experts Computer Parts and Accessories Trading, lT Avenue,
Denver's Computer Shoppe, lnc., and PixelS Web Solutions & Consultancy lnc.;



Field Ofirce V- Bi@l Region

.IE'DSWD 4 \-'
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MA. CAR EN T. TAYAM
AO V, Budget Section Head

Vice-Chairperson

id Division
sro I Member

N/A
MELANIE B. GARRIDO

SWO ll, Soctech
Provisional - Alternate Member

( ) Approved ( )Disapproved

(per 2022)

P 500 899.00

WHEREAS, gEid was received forLol5,

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee RESOLVES, as it is hereby
RESOLVED, to recommend to the HoPE of DSWD FO V to'

a) To declare a Failure of Bidding per Section 35.1.a of the Revised IRR of RA 9184 for the above-
mentioned pro.iect;

Done this 21't of October 2024 in Legazpi City, Philippines.

OB
CLAUDIO A. VILLAREAL JR.

SWO lV, DRMD OIC-Chief
Chairperson

OB
JOSEPH L. TESTON
PO lll, PPD OIC-Chief

Regular Member

JANET BOT
ectionAO II, B

Alternate Member

Authorized e Procuring Entity

L
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LOT 3 ?504,991.00
LOT 4 P989,000.00 ? 951,625.00
LOT 5 P245,000.00 NO BID

Eligible

P
DD

Pr
o,

ional Director, D
cial Order No. 3051, S

SWD FO

e

AN S. LAURIO

DSWD Field Office V, Regional Govemement Center Site. Rawis. Legazpi City, Philippines 4500
Website: IUp i\ !!\\ d!\\ d g, \ Jh y',ta:&

REMARKS

B. BAS


