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Date 21

JoHN cARLo REfl|vo
Authorized Representative
PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY INC
Brgy. 40 Cruzada, Legazpi City

Dear Mr. Renivo

Please be inlormed that you may now proceed as the Supplier for the contract entitled SUPPLY AND
DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) - LOT 1 with ITB
No. lB GOP 2024-DSWD-039 and Contract No. 2024-OZE amounting to EIGHT HUNDRED THIRTY SIX
THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FORTY SIX PESOS AND NO CENTAVOS (P836,746.00), inclusive of all

applicable taxes.

Kindly affix your signature and the rresponding date in the space provided below

2024NOV

Very truly yours,

NORMAN S. LAURI
Regional Director

CONFO

Representative

ilial iaozq

A. EN

o{

F,K

(Please
check typo
of Security)

Form of Pertormance
Security

Amount of Performance Security/ Remarks

Cash or Cashiels / Managefs
Check

Bank DrafUGuarantee or
irrevocable letter of credit

Surety Bond
30% of the Contract Price/Two Hundred Fifty-One Thousand Twenty-three

Pesos and Eighty Centavos (Php.251 ,023.80); Performanc€ Security

Date

Philippines 4500 o y'l8DSWD Fiald Omce v. Regional Govemcment Center Site, Rawis, L€gozpi City,

NOTICE TO PROCEED

This Notica binds you to your bid price proposal, schedule of requirements, technical specifications, and other

terms and conditions stipulated in the Contract. Please note that complete delivery of goods shall be made

within 30 Calendar daya upon receipt of this notice. Further, we acknowledge receipt of your Performance

Security in a form of:
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Republic of the Philippines
DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT

Field Office V, Legazpi City

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV
(CAPITAL OUTLAY) . LOT 1

PROJECT

GoNTRACT NO.. 2O24-O2g

WHEREAS, the Entity invited Bids for certain goods and ancillary services, particularly SUPPLY AND
DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) - LOT 1,

and has accepted a Bid by the Supplier for the supply of those goods and services in the sum of
EIGHT HUNDRED THIRTY SIX THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FORTY SIX PESOS AND NO
CENTAVOS (P836,746.00) hereinafter called "the Contract Price".

1. ln this Agreement words and expressions shall have the same meanings as are respectively
assigned to them in the Conditions of Contract referred to.

2. The following documents as required by the 2016 revised lmplementing Rules and Regulations of
Republic Act No. 9184 shall be deemed to form and be read and construed as integral part of this
Agreement, y2. 

:

Philippine Bidding Documents (PBDs);
i. Schedule of Requirements;
ii. TechnicalSpecifications;
iii. General and Special Conditions of Contract; and
iv. Supplemental or Bid Bulletins, if any

ii. Winning bidder's bid, including the Eligibility requirements, Technical and
Financial Proposals, and all other documents or statements submitted;

Bid form, including all the documents/statements contained in the Bidder's bidding
envelopes, as annexes, and all other documents submitted (e.9., Bidder's response
to request for clarifications on the bid), including corrections to the bid, if any,
resulting from the Procuring Entity's bid evaluation;

Performance Security;

Notice of Award of Contract; and the Bidder's conforme thereto, and

CONTRACT AGREEMENT

TH|S AGREEMENT made this ll0\l 1 5 2024 between DEPARTMENT OF SOCTAL
WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT FIELD OFFICE V of the Philippines, hereinafter called "the Entity",
of the one part and PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC., of Brgy. 40 Cruzada,
Legazpi City hereinafter called "the Supplier" of the other part;

NOW THIS AGREEMENT WITNESSETH AS FOLLOWS:

iii



v. Other contract documents that may be required by existing laws and/or the
Procurrng Entity concerned in the PBDs. Winninq bidder aqrees that additional
contract documents or information prescribed ry the GPPB that are
subsequentlv reouired for submission after the contract execution, such as the

Proceed, Variation Orders, and Warrantv Securitv. shall likewise form
part of the Contract.

4. The DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT FIELD OFFICE V agrees to
pay the above-mentioned sum in accordance with the terms of the Bidding.

lN WITNESS whereof the parties hereto have caused thi Agreement to be executed rn

with the laws of the Republic of the Philippines on the d nd year first above written

OJAS
A$,sh lr r$?&,r JOHN CARLO RENTVO

Authorized Signatory

ATTY. MICHAEL GE o B. BELLENA, CPA BA.SA R€s
Chief Administrati / ICTMS Head itness

for for

Notice to

N

DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL
WELFARE AND DEVELOPMENT

FIELD OFFICE V

PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS &
CONSULTANCY INC.

CERTIFIED F

t
4'WEN RANCES, CPA

A ountant lll

NORMAN S. LAUR
Reg io Director

3. ln consideration for the sum of EIGHT HUNDRED THIRTY SIX THOUSAND SEVEN
HUNDRED FORTY SIX PESOS AND NO CENTAVOS (P836,746.00) or such other sums as may be
ascertained,PlXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC., agrees to provide,SUPPLY AND
DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EOUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) - LOT 1,

in accordance with his/her/its Bid;

DS AVAILABLE:



ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

REPUBLIC OF THE PHTLTPPTNES)

clTY oF .E€AZPI -CIIY )s.s.

c this
Noy 1 5 20atBEFORE ME, a Notary Publi

at
day of
eared

NORMAN S. LAURIO and JOHN CARLO REINO exhibited to me their
Competent Evidence of ldentity lD No. 05-0002 issued in Quezon Citv on
September 2L2022 and lD No.
issued on

issued at
respectively. Known to me to be the person

who executed the foregoing instrument and acknowledgment to me the same
as their free act and that of the principal they represent. This instrument
consists of Three (3) pages including the page, on which, the acknowledgment
is written.

WITNESS MY HAND AND SEAL on the da and place written

0 EONES MAgRII]ATTY. ROB
N 0 Y PUBLIC

Doc. No.
Page No.
Book No.

UNTIL 0ECEMBER 31,2025
rBP N0. 122023 -12 114120?3
PTR, No, 7209144 - 01 I 09 / 24

AT LE6AZFI CITY, AtgAY
ROLL OF ATlORHEY.S N0.30786

McLE Nd. V-60'f705i.Ma-HCll 11! r111E

SeriesNo. lrrnd
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NOTICE OF AWARD

JOHN CARLO RENIVO
Authorized Representative
PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY INC.
Brgy. 40 Cruzada, Legazpi City

Dear Mr. Refrivo:

This is to notify you that your bid for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS &
EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) - LOT 1 with a Contract Price equivalent
to EIGHT HUNDRED THIRTY SIX THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FORTY SIX PESOS AND
NO CENTAVOS (P836,746.00) as corrected and modified in accordance with the lnstructions
to Bidders is hereby accepted.

You are hereby required to provide within ten (10) days the performance security in the form
and amount stipulated in Section 39 of the Revised IRR of RA 9184. Failure to provide the
performance security shall constitute sufficient ground for cancellation of the award and
forfeiture of the bid security.

Very truly

Confome

CARLO RENIVO

5 ?4

PAGI I of I

RMAN S. LAURI
Regional Director

ot

Name of Bidder:

Date Received:

DSWD Field Omc. V, Regional Coveme.nent Center Site, Rswis, Lcgazpi City, Philippincs 4500
Websit€: Ittr! \\\l\\ dsNd]jo\ Ih

o
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BIOS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION No. 2024-10-076

A RESOLUTION RECOMMENDING TO THE REGIONAL DIRECTOR TO AWARD THE CONTRACT FOR THE
SUPPLY ANO OELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) LOT 1 TO

PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY INC. AS THE SOLE ELIGIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDOER

WHEREAS various Programs/Sections requested forthe SUPPLY ANO DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT
FOR OSWO FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) amounting to One Million Sixty-Two Thousand Pesos (P1,062,000.00), hence the
said procurement opportunity was posted on PhIIGEPS per lB GOP 2024-DSWD-039; on the department's websile and
conspicuous places within the agency for wider dissemination;

WHEREAS, the request as mentioned above is included in the Annual Procurement Plan (APP) of the Agency for CY 2024i

WHEREAS, several bidders were presenl during the scheduled Pre-Bid Conference last September 18, 2024, at 8:30 AM,
namely PC Experts Computer Parts and Accessories Trading, lT Avenue, Oenvefs Computer Shoppe, lnc., and PixelS Web
Solutions & Consultancy lnc.;

REQUIREMENTS PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS &
CONSULTANCY INC.

Brgy. 40 Cruzada, Legazpi City
TECHNICAL COMPONENT ENVELOPE

PhiIGEPS Certiticate of Reoistration and Membership Passed
Statement of all ongoing government and private contracts Passed
Statsment of the Bidder's Singlo Largest Completsd
Contract (SLCC) similar to the contract to be bid, within two
(2) years from the submrssion of bids

Passed

Bid Security Passed
Conformitv with technical sDecillcations Passed
Omnibus Sworn Statement Passed
Audited Financial Statement Passed

NFCC computation or Committed Line of Credit (CLC) Passed
Joint Venture Aqreement, if applicable N/A
FINANCIAL PROPOSAL
Financial Bid Form, and the applicable Price Schedules Passed
ABC in Philippine Peso N/A

P 915,000.00 F 836,746.00
P 147,000.00 NO BID

REMARKS Elig ible

WHEREAS, no bid was received for Lot 2;

WHEREAS, per Section 35.1.a of the revised IRR of RA 9184, "The BAC shall declare the bidding a failurc when: xxx a.

No bids ara received;'i Thus, a failure of bidding was declared through BAC Resolution No. 2024-10-062, dated October 21,
2024:

WHEREAS, during the detailed bid evaluation PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. was declared Eligible;

WHEREAS, a post-qualification evalualion was conducted on Oclober 21,2024, by lhe BAC to PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS
& CONSULTANCY lNC. As per report submitted by the Post-Qualification Team, the said bidder was found responsive as
the technical documents submitted such as PhiIGEPS regislration, Bid Security, and Omnibus Sworn Statement are laMul
and valid based on the effectivity date of each document. The required amount of lransaclions for the completed contract is
complied with and surpassed. The Single Largest Completed Contracl presented was with Supply, Delivery and lnstallation
of ICT Equipmenl and Supplies for DSWD FO V amounting lo Pl,371,359.00: Copies of the Contract, Certificate of

PAGE I of 2

DSWD Field Oflic.€ V. Regional Govemement Center Site. Rawis. L.egazpi Ciry. Philippines 4500
websile: hnt $\\ d\sd !,,\ tlr

(I

WHEREAS, during the deadline for the submission/opening of bids on October 01,2024, al8:00 AM, only one (1) bid
proposal was received by the BAC Secretariat as indicated below. Opening of Bids and examination of the presence or
absence of the required eligibility, technical, and financial documents were done using a non-discretionary "pass/tail' criteria
having hereunder result:

'/sB
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Completion, Official Receipt and other related documents were presented upon inspection. The post-qualilication team noted
that the specifications indicated in the bid document were allcomplied.

WHEREAS, PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. was assessed as Post-Qualified by the Post-Qualifcation
Team per submitted PostQualitication Report.

WHEREAS, with the foregoing and after due deliberation, the Bids and Awards Committee resolved to declare the bid of
PIXEL I WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. as Responsive Bid;

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee RESOLVES, as it is hereby RESOLVED, to
recommend to the HoPE of DSWD FO V toi

a) To declare PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. as the Sole and Responsive Bidder for the SUPPLY
AND DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR OSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) LOT 1;

b) To recommend the Award of the Contract to PIXEL I WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. as the Sole and
Reeponsive Bidder for the SUPPLY ANO DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EOUIPMENT FOR OSWD FOV
(CAPITAL OUTLAY) LOT 1 AMOUNT|Ng tO EIGHT HUNDREO THIRTYSIX THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FORTY.
srx PEsos AND No cENTAVOS (p835,746.00).

Done this 29'h 2024 in Legazpi City, Philippines

LAREAL JR.
ON LEAVE

MA. CARMEN T. TAYAM
AO V, Budget Seclion Head

Vice-Chairperson
SWO IV, D MD OIC-Chief

Chairperson

JOSEPH L. TESTON
PO lll. PPD OIC-Chief

Regular Member

D BAS
SAO, P d Division

P

JAN
AO ,

UBOT
Section

MELANIE B. GARRIDO
SWO ll, Soctech

Provisional - Altemate lvlemberAlter lvlember

Authorized

( ) Approved ( ) Disapproved

(per

N

/ Director, DSWD FO V
Oder No. 3051, Series of 2022)

AN S. LAURIO

ative/Head of the

PA(i[ 2 of 2

DSWD Field Ofiice v. Regional Govemement Center Sitc. Ra*is. lrgazpi City, Philippines 4500
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BIDS ANO AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION No. 2024-10-076

A RESOLUTION RECOMMENDING TO THE REGIONAL DIRECTOR TO AWARD THE CONTRACT FOR THE
SUPPLY AND OELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) LOT 1 TO

PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY INC. AS THE SOLE ELIGIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER

WHEREAS various Programs/Seclions requested forthe SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT
FOR DSWD FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) amounting to One Million Sixty-Two Thousand Pesos (Pi,062,000.00), hence the
said proorement opportunity was posted on PhiIGEPS per lB GOP 2024-OSWD{39; on the depadment's website and
conspicuous places within the agency for wider dissemination;

WHEREAS, the request as mentioned above is included in the Annual Procurement Plan (APP) of the Agency lot CY 2024;

WHEREAS, several bidders were present during the scheduled Pre-Bid Conference last Septsmber lE, 2024, at E:30 AM,
namely PC Experts Computer Parts and Accessories Trading, lT Avenue, Denver's Computer Shoppe, lnc., and PixelS Web
Solutions & Consultancy lnc.;

WHEREAS, during the deadline for the submission/opening of bids on October 01,2024, al8:00 AM, only one (1) bid
proposal was rec€ived by the BAC Secretariat as indicated below. Opening of Bids and examinalion of the presence or
absence of the required eligibility, technical, and {inancial documents were done using a non-discretionary "pass/fail' criteria
having hereunder result:

REQUIREMENTS PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS &
CONSULTANCY INC,

Brgy. 40 Cruzada, Legazpi City
TECHNICAL COMPONENT ENVELOPE

PhiIGEPS Certificate of Registration and Membership Passed
Statement of all ongoing government and private contracts Passed
Statement of the Bidder's Single Largest Completed
Contract (SLCC) similar to the contracl to be bid, within two
(2) vears from the submission of bids

Passed

Bid Security Passed
Conformity with technical specifications Passed
Omnibus Sworn Statement Passed
Audited Financial Statement Passed

NFCC computation or Committed Line of Credit (CLC) Passed
Joint Venture Aqreement, if applicable N/A
FINANCIAL PROPOSAL
Financial Bid Form, and the applicable Price Schedules Passed
ABC in Philippine Peso N/A

? 915,000.00 P 836,746.00
F 147,000.00 NO BID

REMARKS Eligible

WHEREAS, no bid was received for Lot 2;

WHEREAS, per Section 35.1.a of the revi36d IRR of RA 9184, "The BAC shall declare the bidding a failure when: xxx a.

No bids arc received;'l Thus, a failure of bidding was declared through BAC Resolution No. 2024-10-062, dated October 2'1,

2024:

WHEREAS, during the detailed bid evaluation PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. was declared Eligible;

WHEREAS, a posl-qualifcalion evalualion was conducled on October 21, 2024, by lhe BAC to PIXEL I WEB SOLUTIONS
& CONSULTANCY lNC. As per report submitted by lhe Post-Oualification Team, the said bidder was found responsive as
the technical documents submitted such as PhiIGEPS registration, Bid Security, and Omnibus Sworn Statement are lawful
and valid based on the effectivity date of each document. The required amount of lransaclions for the completed contract is
complied with and surpassed. The Single Largesl Completed Contracl presenled was with Supply, Delivery and lnstallation
of ICT Equipment and Supplies for DSWO FO V amounting to Pl,371 ,359.00; Copies of the Contract, Cerlilicate of

PAGE I of2
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Completion, Ofticial Receipt and other related documents were presented upon inspection. The post-qualification team noted
that the specillcations indicated in the bid document were all complied.

WHEREAS, PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. was assessed as Post-Oualified by the PoslQualifcation
T6am p6r submitted Post-Qualification Report.

WHEREAS, with the foregoing and afler due deliberation, the Bids and Awards Committee resolved to declare the bid of
PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. as Responsive Bid;

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee RESOLVES, as it is hereby RESOLVED, to
recommend to the HoPE of DSWD FO V to:

b) To recommend the Award of the Contract to PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. as the Sole and
Responsive Bidder for the SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV
(CAPITAL OUTLAY} LOT 1 AMOUNtiNg tO EIGHT HUNDRED THIRTY-SIX THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED FORTY-
slx PEsos AND No cENTAVOS (P836,746.00).

Done this 2024 in Legazpi City, Philippines

BIDS AND AWAR0S COMMTTTEE (BAC)

ON LEAVE
MA. CARMEN T. TAYAM

AO V, Budget Seclion Head
Vice-Chairperson

Division
al lve

MELANIE B. GARRIDO
SWO ll, Soctech

Provisional - Altemate Member

( )Approved ( ) Disapproved

Entity

PA(;E 2 of 2

REAL JR,
lC ChiefSWO IV, DO

Chairperson

JOSEPH L. TESTON
PO lll, PPD OIC-Chief

Regular Member
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a) To declare PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS & CONSULTANCY lNC. as the Sole and Responsive Bidder for the SUPPLY
ANO DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWO FOV (CAPITAL OUTLAY) LOT 1;

SAO,
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WHEREAS, the request as mentioned above

REQUIREMENTS PIXEL 8 WEB SOLUTIONS
& CONSULTANCY INC.

Brgy. 40 Cruzada, Legazpi
City
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Agency for CY 2024,

WHEREAS, several bidders were present during the scheduled Pre-Bid conference last september

18, 2o24,at 8:30 AM, ""';il';';"'tt 
Co-'p'tt|. parts and Accessories Trading' lr Avenue'

Denver's computer Shoppe' ir.it 

" 

'nJ 
pi*"ra web Solutions & Consultancy lnc';

WHEREAS,duringthedeadlineforthesubmission/openingofbidsonoctober0l,2024'a|8:00AM,
onlyone(1)bidproposalw"sreceiveabytheBACsecretariatasindicatedbelow.openingofBids
and examination of the presence or absence of the required eligibility, technical, and financial

documents were done using a non-discretionary "passffail" criteria having hereunder result:

TECHNICAL COMPONENT ENVELOPE
PhiIGEPS Certificate of Registration and Membership Passed

Statement of all ongoing government and private
contracts

Passed

Statement of the Bidder's Single Largest Completed
Contract (SLCC) similar to the contract to be bid, within
two (2) years from the submission of bids

Passed

Bid Security Passed

Conformity with technical specifications Passed

Omnibus Sworn Statement

Audited Financial Statement

NFCC computation or Committed Line of Credit (CLC) Passed

Joint Venture Agreement, if applicable N/A
FINANCIAL PROPOSAL

DSWD Field Ofrice V, Regional Govemement Center Site. Rawis, l-e8azpi Cily, Philirpines 45

d,
00

! y'tl

,\?

Passed

Passed
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MA. CARMEN T. TAYAM
AO V, Budget Section Head

Vice-Chairperson
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N/A
MELANIE B. GARRIDO

SWO ll, Soctech
Provisional - Alternate Member

( )Approved ( ) Disapproved

(per
e Procuring Entity
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Financial Bid Form, and the applicable Price Schedules

ABC in Philippine Peso

P 915,000.00 ? 836,746.00

? 147,000.00 NO BID

REMARKS

Passed

WHEREAS, no bid was received for Lot 2;

WHEREAS, per Section 35.'l.a of the revised IRR of RA 9184, "The BAC shall declare the bidding

a failure when: xxx a. No blds are received;"

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee RESOLVES, as it is hereby

RESOLVEO, to recommend to the HoPE of DSWD FO V to;

a) To declare a Failure of Bidding per Section 35.t.a of the Revised IRR of RA 9184 for the

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ICT PERIPHERALS & EQUIPMENT FOR DSWD FOV
(CAPITAL OUTLAY) LOT 2

Done this 21"1 of October 2024 in Legazpi City, Philippines

OB
CLAUDIO A. VILLAREAL JR.

SWO lV, DRMD OIC-Chief
Chairperson

OB
JOSEPH L. TESTON
PO lll, PPD OIC-Chief

Regular Member

JAN
AO ll,

BOT
ectionJ

Alternate Member

Authorized

t, \(;It 2 0f2

Di
B.D
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P

ional Director, DSWD FO

cial Order No. 3057, Se

N S. LAURIO
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